CITY OF INDIAN HILLS
CITY COUNCIL MEETING
May 29, 2024 Minutes of Special Meeting
City Office - 3905 Brownsboro Road

6:00 p.m.
PRESENT: ABSENT
Mayor: Chip Hancock
Council: Bob Astorino, Sr.

Ann Dreisbach
Laura Dunbar

David Ferguson
Lee Garlove

John Harralson, Il
Chip Hayward, Jr.
Lee Maddox
Kay Matton
Attorney: Finn Cato
Public Works:  Jim Graven
City Clerk: Donna M. Sinkhorn

1) Call to Order — Mayor Hancock called the meeting to order at 5:00 p.m.

Waste Management (Item #3) on Agenda)

(a) 5.24.24 Addendum Il Bid Results re rear door trash collection service limited to elderly, handicapped and
residences with long driveways — Mayor Hancock gave the following 5.24.24 Addendum 1l bid results for
monthly limited rear door service:

Eco-tech Rumpke
7.1.24-6.30.26  7.1.26-6.30.28 7.1.24-6.30.26  7.1.26-6.30.28

a) 1-10residences No charge No charge 19.00+8.00 19.95+8.32
12 free-elderly and/or handicapped-city approved
b) 11-50 residences 38.25/month  40.93 / month  19.00+8.00 19.95+8.32
¢) 51-100 residences No bid No bid 19.00+8.00 19.95+8.32
d) 100+ residences No bid No bid 19.00+8.00 19.95+8.32

All prices bid are on a monthly charge and amount for rear door service would be invoiced directly to the resident.

The first two years of curbside service which will be paid by the city:
Eco-tech’s bid - 24.15 per household x 1185 residences = 343,413 per year
Rumpke’s bid - 25.50 per household x 1185 residences = 362,610 per year or rear door service 447,930 per year

(b) Discussion — The Council’s concerns ranged from Eco-tech’s bidding only up to 50 residences for rear door
service to not offering to all residents due to the excess amount of $105,000 over the curbside service, and that the city
should not treat one resident differently from others. Following much discussion, Councilor Dunbar moved to accept
Rumpke’s curbside trash and recycling bids totaling $25.50 per household per month from July 1, 2024 through June 30,
2026; and $26.78 per household per month from July 1, 2026 through June 30, 2028 to be paid by the city with limited
rear door service offered to residents who are elderly, handicapped or who may have long driveways and require rear
door service to be paid by the resident requiring rear door service and invoiced directly to resident by Rumpke. Motion
seconded by Councilor Dreisbach; none opposed.

Legal — Cato (Item #4 on Agenda)
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(a) Municipal Order No. 4, Series 2024 — Award of Garbage Collection Contract (07.01.2024 — 06.30.2028)
Councilor Dunbar introduced, Attorney Cato read and Councilor Hayward moved to approve Municipal Order No. 4, Series
2024; seconded by Councilor Maddox. Mayor Hancock proceeded to take the following roll call vote:

Mr. Astorino Absent Mr. Harralson  Absent
Ms. Dreisbach  Yea Mr. Hayward Yea
Ms. Dunbar Yea Mr. Maddox Yea
Mr. Ferguson Absent Ms. Matton Yea
Mr. Garlove Yea

Motion passed unanimously. (Municipal Order No. 4, Series 2024)

Rudy Lane Paving Project — Graven (ltem #2 on Agenda) — Mr. Graven would like council approval to begin the bidding
process for a paving project that would include the paving of Rudy Lane and other city streets. The project may cost at
least $204,000. There was general agreement amongst the Council to have Mr. Graven move forward with the paving
project.

Mayor’s comments - None

2) Adjournment — Councilor Hayward moved to adjourn the meeting at 5:55 p.m.; seconded by Councilor Matton,
none opposed.

Next Meeting:
Wednesday — June 19, 2024
6:00 p.m.

[S/
Chip Hancock, Mayor

5
Donna M. Sinkhorn, City Clerk




